
PMI Sweden Chapter Local Recognized for Project Management Journal® Paper of the Year by 
Project Management Institute

Malmö, October 12, 2009—Ralf Müller was awarded the Project Management Journal® Paper of the Year 
Award by Project Management Institute (PMI®) for his significant contribution to project management 
knowledge and was published in Project Management Journal® published by PMI and Wiley in the 
previous year.
 
By honoring the best research paper, the award recognizes significant impact of project management 
research on practice and the importance of refereed journal articles to the advancement of the project 
management body of knowledge.

Dr Ralf Müller is Associate Professor at Umeå University, Adjunct Professor at the Norwegian School of 
Management BI, and at ESC Lille, France. In parallel he is Managing Director of PM Concepts AB, a 
Sweden based management consultancy. He researches in project management, leadership, and 
governance of project-based organizations. Dr Müller authored more than 60 publications including four 
books, several book chapters, and a number of articles in international management journals, as well as 
conference papers. Prior to his academic career he spent 30 years in consulting large enterprises in 
project management and governance, e.g. as worldwide Director of Project Management at NCR 
Teradata.

“The PMI Awards Program recognizes excellence in project management across a broad array of 
categories for organizations, individuals, community advancement and our chapters and their volunteers,” 
said Gregory Balestrero, president and CEO of PMI.  “Winning this award is a testament to the value 
project management brings to our varied stakeholders.”

The PMI Project Management Paper of the Year was presented on October 11, 2009 at the IRNOP 
Conference in Berlin, Germany. 

About Project Management Institute (PMI)
The world’s leading project management organization, PMI shares knowledge with nearly 500,000 
members and credential holders in 185+ countries. Since its founding 40 years ago, PMI has impacted 
more than one million practitioners, businesses, governments, students and training organizations. 
Today, PMI’s products and services range from world-class standards for project, program and portfolio 
management to five professional credentials, including the gold standard Project Management 
Professional (PMP)®. PMI’s exclusive Global Corporate Council and European Corporate Networking 
Group engage large multinationals and government organizations in endorsing the value of project 
management. The only project management association with an established academic research program, 
PMI has invested more than US$14 million in support of dozens of research projects since 1997. Learn 
more at PMI.org.
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